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Number Six and Counting… June 2012 

I sincerely pray the Lord will continue to allow me to travel to Romania (and now Moldova!) 
to help train and encourage my precious Sisters in Christ via the Bible study training 
conferences.  We just held our sixth conference in May, then flew to Moldova to plan the 
upcoming September conference for Chisinau.  I cannot even find enough words or space to 
tell of how wonderfully the Lord blessed us.  Even with a few “challenges” here and there, 
we still saw such an abundance of His grace and tenderness. 

Attached are two pages of pictures in order to give you a snapshot of our trip.  Kim Wier and 
I traveled what seemed like endless air miles, land miles and railway miles to be in many 
different locations this trip. It was Kim’s first time out of the US, and I am so thrilled she got 
to go to Romania and Moldova for that “first” experience.  She was a wonderful guest 
speaker for two different gatherings. Both countries are beautiful.  Even more lovely, though, 
are the women (and three men!) who attended the conference, folks we met along the way, 
familiar faces to kiss and hug again, and precious Moldovan young people who have been 
snatched from the evils of human trafficking by a wonderful ministry called Stella’s Voice. 

The Sighisoara conference was so delightful, and Beth Moore’s sense of humor in the 
Introduction video really came through in spite of the subtitles.  She really is hilarious!  Every 
one of the attendees had been eagerly awaiting the newly translated study, “Living Beyond 
Yourself, Exploring the Fruit of the Spirit.”  I think it is safe to say that they were not 
disappointed!   All three of our translated studies by Beth Moore have greatly blessed 
thousands of families over the years.  I can hardly wait to introduce the fourth study, 
“Breaking Free: The Journey, the Stories”.  Our hope is to produce it this Fall, then introduce 
it in the Spring of 2013. 

The needs are getting greater as their desire for more materials grows.  Only God knows the 
full measure of yearning in my heart to see abundant provision come forth from His 
storehouse to meet these needs.  Almost all of the materials have been distributed, but 
additional funding is necessary to do the reprinting.  At the upcoming September 15th 
conference in Moldova, we will introduce the translated Bible study, “Jesus the One and 
Only” and distribute the final remaining resources. 

East Texas and Romania (and now Moldova!) are separated by an ocean and many miles, 
but in my heart they abide nestled together in harmony. Thank you for your prayers and 
support which continues to allow me this place of sweetness. 

While in Romania, the Lord encouraged me through Psalm 85:12-13 in the NASB:  “Indeed, 
the LORD will give what is good, and our land will yield its produce. Righteousness will go 
before Him and will make His footsteps into a way.”  I felt He showed me that the seeds that 
have been sown across Romania will indeed yield much fruit and that I need to keep my 
eyes on His footsteps instead of circumstances.  Following in His footsteps will open the way 
for His purposes and plans for Beautiful Gate Translations. 

We would love to partner with you as the Lord leads. Donations can be made via our 
website at www.beautifulgatetranslations.org or via mail to the address in the left margin. 

With thankfulness, Paulette 

 
Beautiful Gate Translations is a ministry of Beautiful Ministries, Inc. an IRC 501(c)(3) Non Profit Organization. 

“And all the people saw him walking and praising God; and they were 
taking note of him as being the one who used to sit at the Beautiful 
Gate of the temple to beg alms, and they were fi lled with wonder and 
amazement at what had happened to him.” Acts 3:9-10 NASB 
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